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A message 
from the President 

 
I would like to thank all of those Marshall 

Scholars who responded to our year-end dues 
contribution solicitation.  Marshall Scholars 
contributed over $14,000, which will help 
support the Association's ongoing operations 
and make a significant contribution to the 
Capital Fund.  The British Council officials 
assisting the fundraising effort were very im-
pressed by this showing of American generos-
ity — and all of us appreciate the laudable 
spirit these contributions represented.   The 
updates that scholars provided will be pub-
lished in future editions of this newsletter. 

 
This year, the Marshall Aid Commemora-

tion Commission has volunteered to help pub-
lish a hard-copy Directory of Marshall Schol-
ars, which should be a valuable tool in en-
couraging connection among the Marshall 
Scholarship community.  We are currently try-
ing to update information on the Marshall 
Scholars, so if your information has changed 
or if you know the coordinates of any of the 
“lost” Scholars listed at the end of newsletter, 
we would certainly appreciate receiving that 
information.  Please contact Kathy Culpin of 
the British Council at Kathy.Culpin@us.bri-
tish-council.org with any pertinent informa-
tion. 

 
— Robert D. Kyle (’77) 

President 
Marshall Scholars Association  

2004 Marshalls 
Announced 

 
The 2004 Marshall Scholars have been 

announced, and are as follows: 
 
Sameer Ahmed, Stanford University, 
School of Oriental and African Studies, Mid-
dle East Politics  
   
Lee Bassett, Pennsylvania State University, 
University of Cambridge, Mathematics  
 
Jessica Benson, Ohio University, 
Imperial College London, Organic Photovol-
taics  
   
Ian Bonzani, Worcester Polytechnic Institute, 
Imperial College London, Tissue Engineering  
   
Morgan Carberry, Wellesley College, 
Royal Scottish Academy of Music and Drama, 
Musical Theater  
   
Tracy Carson, Northwestern University 
University of Oxford, African History  
   
David Chacko, University of Southern Cali-
fornia, University of Oxford, Comparative So-
cial Policy  
   
Daniel Davis, Johns Hopkins University, 
Royal Academy of Music, Composition  
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Jennifer Devine, University of Washington, 
London School of Economics, Gender, Devel-
opment and Globalization  
   
Ethan Eade, Duke University, 
University of Cambridge, Information Engi-
neering  
   
Katharine Elswit, Northwestern University, 
Laban Centre, European Dance Theater  
   
Jared English, Michigan State University, 
London School of Economics, Politics of the 
World Economy  
   
Scott Grinsell, Williams College, 
University of Oxford, Modern History  
   
Adam Grogg, Williams College, 
University of Oxford, Comparative Social 
Policy  
   
Margaret Hagan, University of Chicago, 
Queen’s University of Belfast, Political Sci-
ence  
   
Sondra Hellstrom, Johns Hopkins Univer-
sity, Imperial College London, Nanomaterials  
   
Thomas Kempa, Boston College, 
Imperial College London, Electronic Materials  
   
Andrew Klaber, Yale University, 
University of Oxford, Development Studies  
   
Miriam Krieger, U.S. Air Force Academy, 
London School of Economics, Global Politics  
   
Natalie Kruse, Ohio University, 
University of Newcastle upon Tyne, Aban-
doned Mine Modelling  
   
Nicholas Llewellyn, Emory University, 
University of Cambridge, Chemistry  
   

Christopher Macklin, Oberlin College, 
University College London, Neuroscience  
   
Jason Mellad, Tulane University, 
University of Cambridge, Gene Therapy  
   
Kurt Mitman, University of Virginia, 
University of Oxford, Physics  
   
Tyler Moore, University of Tulsa, 
University of Cambridge, Computer Science  
   
Marden Nichols, Stanford University, 
University of Cambridge, Archaeological 
Heritage and Museums  
   
Daniel Pastor, Princeton University, 
University of Oxford, Politics  
   
Nickolas Rodriguez, Stanford University, 
London School of Economics, Public Finan-
cial Policy  
   
Maia Schweizer, Princeton University, 
University of Oxford, Earth Sciences  
   
James Scott, University of Texas, 
University of Cambridge, Mathematics  
   
Joshua Siepel, Texas A & M University, 
University of Sussex, Science and Technology 
Policy  
   
Greta Stahl, Michigan State University, 
University of Oxford, International Relations  
   
Michael Sulmeyer, Stanford University, 
Kings College London, War Studies  
   
Eric Twerdahl Jr., U.S. Naval Academy, 
University of Oxford, Biochemistry  
   
James Valpiani, U.S. Air Force Academy, 
University of Oxford, Engineering Science  
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Nilay Vora, University of Southern Califor-
nia, London School of Economics, Human 
Rights  
   
Elizabeth Wang, University of California, 
Berkeley, London School of Economics, Hu-
man Rights  
   
Joseph Wells, U.S. Military Academy, 
University of Birmingham, International Stud-
ies (International Peace Keeping)  
   
Maya Weilundemo, Texas A & M Univer-
sity, University of Sussex, Creative and Criti-
cal Writing  
   
Tracy Williams, Stanford University, 
University of Wales, Aberystwyth, Interna-
tional History  
   
James Wilkins, Bowdoin College, 
University of Oxford, Musculoskeletal Sci-
ence  
   
Hayley Wolfe, Julliard School of Music, 
Royal Academy of Music, Violin Performance  
  
Joseph Wolpin, University of Georgia, 
School of Slavonic and East European Studies 
(UCL), Politics, Security and Integration 
 
Jia Xu, Georgia Institute of Technology, 
London School of Economics, International 
Relations  
 

New Scholarships 
Available 

 
Starting with the 2004 Scholars, the Mar-

shall Aid Commemoration Commission has 
begun awarding additional, specialized Mar-
shall Scholarships, in addition to the usual 40 
Scholarships awarded each year, as the final 
step in the plans to increase the number of 

available Scholarships.  These Scholarships 
are the result of new partnerships with Impe-
rial College London, the University of Not-
tingham, the U.K. Department of Trade and 
Industry, and the U.S. National Institutes of 
Health. 

 
Three Imperial Marshall Scholarships 

will be awarded each year for the study in any 
subject offered at Imperial College London.  
These Scholarships will be for three years. 

 
One Nottingham Marshall Scholarship 

will be awarded annually for the study of any 
subject at either master’s or doctoral level.  
The Scholarship will be for two years, with 
the possibility of a third year for doctoral stud-
ies. 

 
In order to be considered for the Imperial 

or Nottingham Marshall Scholarships, candi-
dates will be required to list those respective 
institutions as either their first or second 
choice on their applications. 

 
Finally, one Texas Marshall Scholarship 

will be awarded each year for research or 
taught courses in the subject areas of biosci-
ence, medicine, and related disciplines with 
predominant application in bioscience.  To be 
eligible for this scholarship, candidates must 
be either attending or have graduated from a 
leading university in Texas, and must apply 
through the Houston region:  This scholarship 
is funded by the British Department of Trade 
and Industry. 

 
Finally, any Marshall Scholar who is se-

lected for research in a biomedical or science 
field will be eligible for the NIH Marshall 
Scholarships.  Chosen scholars will spend 
two years in the UK as regular Marshall 
Scholars, then will spend the next two years at 
the U.S. National Institutes of Health in Be-
thesda, Md., conducting research.  The chosen 
scholar will receive joint supervision from 
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their British university and the NIH, and will 
ultimately receive a doctoral degree from the 
British institution. 
 

London Celebration 
Marks Anniversary 

 
Almost 100 current and former Marshall 

Scholars and scores of distinguished guests 
gathered for a celebration of the 50th anniver-
sary of the Marshall Scholarships and the 
presentation of the first Marshall Medals on 
November 19.  The ceremony, which took 
place in the elegant Senate House at the Uni-
versity of London, was hosted by CNN’s 
Christiane Amanpour and the BBC’s Jeremy 
Paxman. 

 
The keynote address at the event was de-

livered by Thomas Friedman (’75), foreign 
affairs columnist for the New York Times.  
Friedman praised the long-standing “special 
relationship” between the United States and 
the United Kingdom, and argued for the main-
tenance and strengthening of programs like 
the Marshall Scholarship which contribute to 
strong transatlantic ties. 

 
The Marshall Medals are intended to 

commemorate the achievements of distin-
guished Americans who have contributed to 
some aspect of British-American relations.  
The inaugural medals were awarded to Fried-
man; Ray Dolby (’57), inventor of digital 
sound technologies; Nannerl Keohane (’61), 
president of Duke University; and former U.S. 
Senator George Mitchell, now Chancellor of 
Queen’s University,  Belfast, who facilitated 
the peace process in Northern Ireland in the 
1990s.  Supreme Court Justice Stephen 
Breyer (’59); Christopher Makins, President 
of the Marshall Sherfield Foundation; and 
Secretary of State Colin Powell were also 

awarded medals but were unable to attend the 
ceremony.   

 
HRH The Prince of Wales delighted the 

crowd with a brief speech.  He joked, “I am 
very proud to be the honorary patron of the 
Marshall Scholarships — although I have no 
idea why I am the honorary patron considering 
my own academic record.”  At the reception 
after the event, many scholars took the oppor-
tunity to speak with Prince Charles, who min-
gled with the crowd. 

 
Current scholars also gathered informally 

before and after the event with a number of 
former scholars, including Friedman and 
Time’s London bureau chief, Jef McAllister 
(’79).  The former scholars shared stories of 
their time as students in England and reflected 
on their careers.  “Meeting successful Mar-
shalls gives us something to aspire to,” said 
Vipin Narang (’02), a Stanford alumnus who 
is studying international relations at Oxford.   

 
Jonathan Taylor, chairman of the Marshall 

Commission, noted that some 1,400 Ameri-
cans have now served as Marshall Scholars, 
and assured that their ranks would continue to 
grow in the coming years. 
 

— Daniel Baer (’01) 
 

Joe Eachus, Husband 
of Barbara, Dies 

 
Joe Eachus, husband of Barbara Eachus, 

passed away in Boston on December 9. 
 
The Eachuses were well known to several 

generations of Marshall Scholars.  After she 
retired, Barbara (who worked at the British 
Consulate in Boston) and Joe, with a small 
cadre of Marshall alumni, established the 
Marshall Scholar Alumni Association.  They 
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spent hundreds of hours tracking down past 
Marshalls — no mean feat in the pre-Internet 
era — and established the first Alumni Asso-
ciation database.  For a number of years, they 
also produced the Association newsletter. 

 
Donations in Joe’s memory should be sent 

to the Bletchley Park Trust, The Mansion, 
Bletchley Park, Milton Keynes MK3 6EB, 
England.  The next edition of the Alumni As-
sociation Directory will be dedicated to Joe’s 
memory.  He will be sorely missed. 

 
— Terri Evans, 

Robert D. Kyle (’77), 
and Kannon Shanmugam (’93) 

 

Launching A 
“Marshall Plan” 
For Rwanda’s First 
Public Library 

 
In September 2002, the 2002 class of Mar-

shall Scholars took the unprecedented step of 
collaborating to support a cause reflective of 
the humanitarian spirit and ideals of the Mar-
shall Scholarships.  Recognizing that Marshall 
Scholars are chosen in part for their commit-
ment to George Marshall’s lofty principles, 
our class thought it important that Marshall 
Scholars demonstrate this commitment not 
only with words but with action.  For this rea-
son, the 2002 Marshall Scholars formed Mar-
shall Scholars for the Kigali Public Library 
(MSKPL), an organization that aims to help 
realize the dream of building Rwanda’s first 
public library. 

 
For decades, Rwanda suffered from isola-

tion, violence, and extremism, culminating in 
a 1994 genocide during which the country’s 
Hutu ethnic majority orchestrated the brutal 

murder of approximately one million Rwan-
dans of Tutsi ethnic descent.  This genocide 
left the country devastated, severely depleting 
the population and destroying the foundation 
of trust and mutual cooperation necessary for 
democracy to thrive.  Today, however, 
Rwanda has begun to rebuild its government, 
its infrastructure, and its social bonds.  One of 
the most integral projects in this process is the 
construction of Rwanda’s first public library. 

 
Democracy requires a well-informed 

population, and maintaining peace in a post-
conflict society requires public spaces where 
people can gather and exchange ideas.  The 
Kigali Public Library seeks to provide both. 
Successful completion of this monumental 
effort will mark a watershed in Rwanda’s his-
tory.  Whereas Rwandans were once armed 
only with the tools to kill, it is our hope that 
this library will equip them with the tools nec-
essary to combat the stultifying burdens of 
ignorance and conformity and to rebuild 
Rwandan society. 

 
The construction of the Kigali Public Li-

brary will also send a strong message to the 
Rwandan people and to the world that this 
troubled country is committed to opening a 
new chapter in its history.  The library will not 
only be a sanctuary for knowledge and a fo-
rum for the free exchange of ideas, but also a 
symbolic monument to genocide victims and a 
permanent reminder that the atrocities com-
mitted in 1994 will never be forgotten. 

 
When we formed MSKPL, the Kigali Pub-

lic Library campaign had already donations 
and pledges of over $1 million.  Those contri-
butions came from individuals, foundations, 
corporations, governments, and intergovern-
mental organizations.  Among the donors were 
Rotary International; The Dian Fossey Gorilla 
Fund International; The Boeing Company; the 
Governments of Canada, Switzerland, and 
Rwanda; and the European Union.  However, 
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the campaign still needed another $200,000 to 
allow the library to open, and another 
$500,000 to secure the library’s $1.7 million 
endowment and ensure the library’s sustain-
ability. 

 
Therefore, our efforts to support the Kigali 

Public Library are threefold.  At Oxford, 
where the largest group of 2002 Marshall 
Scholars is based, we have established a Fund-
raising Committee, led by Lauren Baer (’02).  
This committee has launched an extensive 
campaign to solicit contributions from Ameri-
can and European sources.  To date, several 
thousand dollars has already been raised, and 
in addition, the academic publisher W.W. 
Norton & Co. has pledged 12,500 books for 
the library.  MSKPL has also received en-
dorsements from the Marshall Aid Com-
memoration Commission; the Marshall 
Alumni Association; the Rotary Clubs of 
Cambridge, England; Palm Beach, Florida; 
and West Palm Beach, Florida; Dr. John 
Brademas, President Emeritus of New York 
University and former United States Con-
gressman; and Harry A. Johnston, II, former 
United States Congressman and former 
Chairman of the Africa Sub-Committee of the 
House Committee on International Relations. 

 
The efforts of our fundraising committee 

are complemented by our London-based Pub-
lic Awareness Committee.  This committee 
has initiated a campaign that includes solicit-
ing press coverage of the library and 
MSKPL’s efforts as well as arranging speak-
ing engagements to educate the public about 
our cause.  Speeches have been delivered to 
the Rotary Clubs in Oxford and Cambridge, 
England; Palm Beach and West Palm Beach, 
Florida; and in Umeå, Sweden, and future 
speaking engagements are scheduled at the 
University of Wales, Aberystwyth; the Uni-
versity of Nottingham; and at Rotary Clubs in 
Radlett, England, and Wellesley, Massachu-
setts. It is our hope that such awareness-

raising activities will draw national and inter-
national attention to the project, thereby assist-
ing both our fundraising efforts and the cause 
of genocide recovery and prevention. 

 
Finally, we are planning a trip to Rwanda 

in July which will coincide with the planned 
grand opening of the library.  In conjunction 
with our Rwandan colleagues, we have devel-
oped an itinerary that involves service to the 
library, education, cross-cultural interaction, 
and publicity.  There, we intend to present the 
KPL with a check in the total amount of funds 
raised to date, assist final preparations for the 
library opening, conduct genocide site visits 
with survivor groups, meet with government 
officials and civil society organizations and 
conduct literacy and education programs at 
areas schools at the invitation of U.S. Ambas-
sador to Rwanda Margaret McMillion.  To us, 
this trip is not merely a culmination of our 
fundraising and public awareness efforts. 
Rather, it is a means of engaging with the 
people of Rwanda, of learning from their ex-
periences and laying the foundation for future 
collaboration.  It is a way to remind the world 
of the horrors of 1994 and to educate people 
about the progress Rwanda has made.  It is a 
way of using our intellect and effort to im-
prove the world in which we live.  

 
As Marshall alumni, you have the poten-

tial greatly to facilitate the success of our pro-
ject, and we seek your support in achieving 
our goals.  The first and most obvious way to 
aid the Kigali Public Library is by making a 
tax-deductible donation.  We would welcome 
both financial donations and in-kind donations 
(of books, computers, and training). 

 
The second way you can help is by sharing 

your knowledge and contacts.  We would be 
most appreciative if you introduced us to other 
individuals and organizations that might be 
interested in supporting the Kigali Public Li-
brary, whether financially or otherwise.  
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Finally, and most importantly, you can 
join MSKPL yourself, raise public awareness 
about the library, and help us to solicit funds. 

 
If you have any questions about these mat-

ters, please contact us. 
 
It is a rare privilege to live in a society that 

makes possible the free exchange of ideas and 
the unfettered pursuit of knowledge. We hope 
that you will join us in making such a society 
possible for the people of Rwanda. 

 
— Zachary D. Kaufman (’02) 

and Lauren E. Baer (’02) 
 

Editor’s note: Zachary Kaufman is presi-
dent of MSKPL, and Lauren Baer is fundrais-
ing director.  For more information, they can 
be contacted at zachary.kaufman@magd.ox. 
ac.uk and lauren.baer@stcatz.ox.ac.uk.  The 
website of MSKPL can be found at 
www.marshallscholarship.org/kpl.  Dona-
tions, made out to The American Friends of 
the Kigali Public Library, can be sent to Zach-
ary Kaufman, Magdalen College, Oxford OX1 
4AU, England. 
 

Koh Named 
Yale Dean 
 

Yale University recently announced the 
appointment of Harold Hongju Koh (’75),  
an expert on human rights and international 
law, as dean of Yale Law School.  Koh, who 
has taught at Yale Law School since 1985, 
served as Assistant Secretary of State for De-
mocracy, Human Rights and Labor from 1998 
to 2001. 

 
“As a scholar, teacher, lawyer and public 

servant, Harold Koh embodies those qualities 
that distinguish Yale’s great Law School — a 
love of learning and a passion for justice,” 

Yale President Richard C. Levin said.  “He is 
a natural leader who has earned the over-
whelming support and confidence of faculty, 
students, alumni and staff. We all look for-
ward to his stewardship.” 

 
Koh, 48, the Gerard C. and Bernice La-

trobe Smith Professor of International Law, is 
one of the country's leading experts on inter-
national law, international human rights, na-
tional security law, and international eco-
nomic law. He has received more than twenty 
awards for his human rights work. He was 
named by American Lawyer in 1997 as one of 
America’s 45 leading public sector lawyers 
under the age of 45.  In 2000, he was named 
by A as one of the 100 most influential Asian-
Americans of the 1990s. 

 
“It is the greatest honor of my life to be 

asked to serve as dean of the world’s leading 
law school,” Koh said. “For four decades I 
have been privileged to participate in that 
unique community of commitment to world-
class scholarship, public service and profes-
sional excellence that Yale Law School repre-
sents. I look forward to leading this school I 
love into a new global century.” 

 
Koh has written more than 80 articles and 

authored or co-edited “Different But Equal: 
The Human Rights of Persons with Intellec-
tual Disabilities” (2003); “Transnational Busi-
ness Problems” (2003); “Deliberative Democ-
racy and Human Rights” (1999); the “Justice 
Harry Blackmun Supreme Court Oral History” 
(1995, release date 2004); “Transnational Le-
gal Problems” (1984); and “The National Se-
curity Constitution” (1990), which won the 
American Political Science Association's 
award as best book on the American presi-
dency. His current research concerns why na-
tions do or do not obey international law. 

 
A graduate of Harvard College, Oxford 

and Harvard Law School, Koh served as law 
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clerk to Judge Malcolm Wilkey of the U.S. 
Court of Appeals for the D.C. Circuit, and Jus-
tice Harry Blackmun of the U.S. Supreme 
Court.  Before coming to Yale, he practiced 
law at the Washington law firm of Covington 
and Burling and at the Office of Legal Coun-
sel at the Department of Justice. 

 
A Fellow of the American Academy of 

Arts and Sciences, Koh is an Honorary Fellow 
of Magdalen College, Oxford, and has been a 
Visiting Fellow at All Souls College, Oxford.  
He is an Overseer of Harvard University and 
on the Visiting Committee of Harvard Law 
School, an editor of the American Journal of 
International Law and a member of the 
American Law Institute. He has received 
Guggenheim and Century Foundation Fellow-
ships and has been awarded seven honorary 
doctorates and law school medals from the 
Villanova Law School and Touro Law School. 
In 2003, Columbia Law School awarded him 
the Wolfgang Friedmann Memorial Award for 
his contributions to international law. 

 
The Koh family came to New Haven in 

1961.  Koh; his brother, Howard; his mother, 
Dr. Hesung Chun Koh; and his father, the late 
Dr. Kwang Lim Koh, were recently named to 
the K100, the 100 leading Koreans and Ko-
rean-Americans in the century of Korean im-
migration to the United States.  His parents 
and his sister, Jean Koh Peters, have all taught 
at Yale Law School.  Koh lives in New Haven 
with his wife, Mary-Christy Fisher, an attor-
ney at New Haven Legal Assistance Associa-
tion, and their children, Emily and William. 

 
Koh’s five-year term will begin in July.  

He is the second former Marshall Scholar to 
be appointed dean of a major American law 
school in recent years.  Kathleen Sullivan 
(’76) currently serves as dean of the Stanford 
Law School.  She recently announced that she 
would be stepping down at the end of the aca-
demic year to return to teaching. 

— compiled from press reports 
by Kannon Shanmugam (’93) 

 

Class Notes 
 
1959 

 
Frank Trumbower recently lost his wife 

to cancer.  He intends to move back to New 
York and split his time between New York 
and Park City, Utah.  We send Frank our sin-
cerest condolences. 

 
 
1969 

 
Robert A. Oden, Jr. (Pembroke College, 

Cambridge), is now in his second year as the 
president of Carleton College, after seven 
years as the president of Kenyon College. 
Says Robert: “American liberal arts colleges 
are a distinct, even unique, construction, and 
I’m not convinced there is a finer such than 
Carleton.” 

 
1970 

 
Jean E. Howard (University College, 

London) is now a professor of English at Co-
lumbia University.  This academic year, she is 
serving as a research fellow at the Huntington 
Library in Pasadena, California, where she is 
finishing a book called “Theater of a City: So-
cial Change and Generic Innovation on the 
Early Modern Stage.”  Her son, Caleb, is a 
sophomore at Oberlin, and her daughter, 
Katherine, has graduated from Yale and is 
participating in the Teach for America pro-
gram in Compton, California.  Her husband, 
Jim, practices public service law in New York 
City. 
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1971 
 
Marty Kaplan is associate dean of the 

USC Annenberg School for Communication. 
 
1972 

 
Bob Rizzi is a tax partner in the law firm 

of O’Melveny and Myers LLP in Washington 
and Menlo Park, Cal. 

 
1975 

 
John Head (University College, Oxford) 

is in his 13th year of teaching international 
and comparative law at the University of Kan-
sas, where he moved after serving on the legal 
staffs of the Asian Development Bank and the 
International Monetary Fund.  He recently co-
authored a book on preventing banking crises 
in less developed countries and published an-
other book on the Asian Development Bank.  
He often takes on overseas assignments — 
either teaching or consulting — in the summer 
months, typically with one of his children be-
fore they all leave the house.  His wife, Lucia, 
is a novelist.  Their children are Alex, cur-
rently a junior at Pomona College near  Los 
Angeles; Austen, a high school senior consid-
ering college possibilities, and Jessica, a high 
school junior “considering boys.” 

 
Joseph M. Schwartz is an associate pro-

fessor and chair of the political science de-
partment at Temple University. 

 
1982 

 
John B. Stephens was recently granted 

tenure and promoted to associate professor of 
government at the University of North Caro-
lina at Chapel Hill.  He directs the Public Dis-
pute Resolution Program there and has be-
come editor of Popular Government, the flag-
ship journal of the School of Government. 
 

1986 
 
After three years in the State Department’s 

Political-Military Affairs Bureau, working 
mostly on Nepalese issues, Paul Marks (Uni-
versity of London) is now teaching Chinese at 
West Point.  “I remain eternally grateful for 
the opportunity the Marshall Scholarship pro-
vided,” says Paul. 
 
1987 

 
Brian Taylor is an assistant professor of 

political science at the University of Okla-
homa.  His book, Politics and the Russian 
Army: Civil-Military Relations, 1689-2000, 
was published by Cambridge University Press 
last year.   He and his wife, Renee de Nevers, 
have two-year-old twin sons, Anatol and 
Lucian de Nevers. 

 
1988 

 
Patrick Byrne is chief executive of Over-

stock.com, a discount shopping website that is 
one of the Web’s top e-commerce sites.  His 
company was recently profiled in the Boston 
Globe. 

 
1989 

 
Thomas Halverson is living in Hong 

Kong and would like to meet any other Mar-
shalls who happen to be in the neighborhood. 
He is the head of Credit Risk Management 
and Advisory for Asia Ex-Japan at Goldman 
Sachs Asia and has been living in Hong Kong 
with his wife and two daughters since finally 
leaving London in 2001.  His e-mail address is 
tom.halverson@gs.com. 

 
1993 

 
A ten-year reunion was held in New York 

on November 22.  Among those in attendance 
were Josh Busby; Shizuka Hsieh; Nancy 
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Lublin; Michelle Mello; Matt Ringel; Kan-
non Shanmugam; Loren Siebert; and a 
number of spouses and partners.  As the editor 
can attest, it was a wonderful evening, with 
many fond reminiscences of our time together 
in the UK.  A fifteenth reunion is already be-
ing planned for 2008. 

 
Kate Rodriguez-Clark is a postdoctoral 

fellow in conservation genetics at the Vene-
zuelan Institute for Scientific Investigation. 

 
1997 

 
Jade Newburn (Balliol College, Oxford) 

worked for two years as an associate at 
McKinsey & Co. in Chicago, and then at-
tended Harvard Law School.  He will return to 
Chicago this summer as an associate with the 
law firm of Mayer, Brown, Rowe & Maw.  In 
2002, he married Mary Lubner.  His e-mail 
address is jade_newburn@hotmail.com. 

 
— compiled from alumni submissions and 

press reports by Kannon Shanmugam (’93)  
 

Missing Out? 
 
If you would like to be included in the 

Class Notes section, or have information about 
your classmates for inclusion, please send an 
e-mail to Kathy.Culpin@us.britishcouncil. 
org.  Entries may be edited for length and con-
sistency.  The deadline for the next edition of 
the newsletter is June 30. 

List of the Lost 
 
The following Marshall Scholars have 

been “lost.”  If you know of their where-
abouts, please contact Kathy Culpin of the 
British Council at Kathy.Culpin@us.british-
council.org.  Thanks in advance for your help. 

1954 
MCLEOD Norma 
London School of Economics and Political 
Science 
 
1954 
TILSON Phyllis Wiegand 
Oxford St Anne's 
 
1955 
BALTZELL Jane Lucile 
Cambridge Newnham 
 
1955 
DUNBIER Robert Augustus 
Oxford St Edmund Hall 
 
1956 
HUDEC Robert Emil 
Cambridge Jesus 
 
1956 
JOHNSON Shirley Beatrice 
University of Edinburgh 
 
1956 
KEMP Elsie Wilhelmina 
Cambridge Girton 
 
1957 
CORN Ruth Eleanor 
Cambridge New Hall 
 
1957 
MIMS Amy Williamson 
Oxford Lady Margaret Hall 
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1958 
RHEA Elizabeth Elliotte 
Oxford Lady Margaret Hall 
 
1958 
JOHNSON Owen Maynard 
Oxford Wadham 
 
1958 
NOVAK Alan Richard 
Oxford Hertford 
 
1958 
O'GRADY Gerald Leo 
Oxford St Antony's 
 
1959 
ROBBINS David Dean 
Cambridge Trinity 
 
1959 
MOYER Patricia Ann 
University of Nottingham 
 
1960 
ABRAMS Judith Ann 
Cambridge Girton 
 
1960 
MCNEES John Earl 
Oxford New College 
 
1960 
MONTOYA Velma Kamalina 
Oxford St Hugh's 
 
1960 
RADNER John Barnet 
Cambridge Trinity 
 
1960 
ROBERTSON Joseph Righton 
Oxford Wadham 
 
 
 

1960 
BUDD Martin Lewis 
Oxford Worcester 
 
1960 
FRYXELL Redwood Thomas Walcott 
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